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Electronic Contractor Keeps On Top of Assests and Inventory

Summary:

When this Electrical Contractor needed a way to keep tabs on the 
location of its numerous pieces of equipment, spanning multiple job 
sites, Barcode+ offered a solution that allows them to place a bar-
code label on each item and maintain a record of where that item is 
located.  They were also given a sheet of barcodes representing each 
truck that an item would be located.  After scanning the equipment’s 
id tag, they simply scan the item’s new location or key it into the bar-
code scanning device using the keypad.

Skyline Electric was able to take advantage of the multiple data 
groups offered in Barcode+ by using a second group to keep track of 
their inventory items and consumables.  With a barcode, a descrip-
tion, a quantity and a location field, Skyline is able to know what they 
have in stock and where that item is.

Barcode+ is a customizable multipurpose data collection and man-
agement tool that was built to handle numerous situations and data 
collection requirements.  Barcode+ uses 4 customizable data groups 
each with 8 customizable fields to store information, look up entries 
instantly using a barcode scan, edit item information and send this 
information to a desktop computer.

Barcode+ was designed for both Palm and Windows Mobile platforms 
and works on a variety of barcode scanning devices like the Aceeca 
Mezura, the Janam XP30, the Symbol MC50 and MC70, Unitech 
PA500 and PA60, the Janam XM60 and XM65.  Barcode+ includes 
a desktop application that’s used to customize data groups, import 
data, view data and synchronize data to and from the barcode scan-
ning device.
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